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Axiom product code:
ASO5030 - Satin.

Stainless steel Stand off
fitting 50mm Dia. x 30mm
long stand off length.
Supplied with a 100mm
long M12 rod.

12

1mm thick black plastic
spacer to fit between the
glass and stainless steel
fitting.

16.3mm Dia. plastic
washer.

For placing our patch fitting
against timber. Use our
110mm long x M12 Lag
screw to fix into the timber.
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For placing our patch
fitting against concrete.
Use our 120mm long x
M12 all thread to fix into
the concrete.
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Specification of Axiom product ASO5030 - Satin.

For placing our patch
fitting against steel. Use
our M12 thread bolt. The
length of the bolt will need
to suit the steel thickness.

All three of these fittings
are designed to screw into
the back of our patch
fittings.
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